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Resumo		

Este	 artigo	 trata	 da	 elaboração	 e	 uso	 do	 conceito	 de	 estrutura	 básica	 da	
constituição	 em	 diferentes	 jurisdições,	 principalmente	 da	 Europa	 e	 da	
América	Latina.	Por	meio	dessa	análise	comparada,	pretende-se	provar	que	o	
critério	 empregado	 para	 o	 julgamento	 constitucional	 de	 emendas	 tem	 um	
alcance	e	conteúdo	específicos,	e	que	tanto	o	alcance	quanto	o	conteúdo	são	
decididos	principalmente	pelos	tribunais.	Depois	de	explicar	os	argumentos	
que	os	tribunais	empregaram	para	justificar	seu	papel,	o	artigo	se	concentra	
nas	diferentes	denominações	de	“estrutura	básica”	no	conjunto	dos	estudos	
de	 casos	 selecionados,	 concentrando-se,	 finalmente,	 no	papel	 dos	 tribunais	
constitucionais	e	supremos.	

Palavras-chave:	 justiça	 constitucional,	 emendas	 constitucionais,	 direito	
comparado,	critério,	estrutura	básica.	

	

Abstract	

This	 article	 deals	 with	 the	 elaboration	 and	 use	 of	 the	 concept	 of	 a	 basic	
structure	of	the	constitution	in	different	jurisdiction,	especially	from	Europe	
and	Latin	America.	Through	this	comparative	analysis,	 it	aims	to	prove	that	
the	yardstick	employed	for	constitutional	adjudication	on	amendments	has	a	
specific	 scope	 and	 content,	 and	 that	 both	 scope	 and	 content	 are	 mainly	
decided	by	courts.	After	explaining	the	arguments	courts	have	employed	 in	
order	 to	 justify	 their	 role,	 it	 focuses	 on	 the	 different	 denominations	 of	 the	
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“basic	structure”	in	the	set	of	the	selected	case	studies,	finally	concentrating	
on	the	role	of	constitutional	and	supreme	courts.	

Keywords:	 constitutional	 adjudication,	 constitutional	 amendments,		
comparative	law,	yardstick,	basic	structure.	

	
	

Introduction	
	

The	 paper	 analyzes,	 from	 a	 comparative	 perspective,	 the	 elaboration	 by	 Supreme	 and	
Constitutional	Courts	of	the	concept	of	“basic	structure”	 lato	sensu,	 i.e.	a	series	of	elements	that	
cannot	 be	 amended	 because	 their	 change	 would	 lead	 to	 the	
replacement/annulment/dismemberment	(Albert,	2018)	of	the	original	constitution.	

Through	several	examples	from	Europe	and	Latin	America,	the	text	examines	the	arguments	
and	grounds	used	by	comparative	jurisprudence	in	order	to	construe	and	implement	such	limits	to	
the	amending	power.	 It	 also	differentiates	between	diverse	amending	procedures,	 explaining	 to	
what	extent	 the	 corresponding	Courts	have	adopted	distinct	 yardsticks	according	 to	 the	 specific	
procedure	and	its	level	of	inclusiveness.	

The	paper	has	as	background	the	Indian	case	law,	because	it	provided	the	first	elaboration	of	
the	concept	of	“basic	structure”2,	which	has	been	widely	analyzed	by	the	scholarship	(see	at	least	
Lakshminath,	2002;	Krishnaswamy,	2011;	Basu,	2014;	Seervai,	2015;	Joshi,	2015;	on	the	historical	
and	 political	 aspects,	 as	well	 as	 a	 chronological	 reconstruction	 of	 the	 connections	 between	 the	
Supreme	Court	of	 India	 and	 legislative	 and	executive	powers,	 see	Thiruvengadam,	2017;	Albert,	
Nakashidze,	Olcay,	2018;	Dixon,	Landau,	2015),	assessing	the	elements	of	similarity	and	difference	
with	respect	to	posterior	uses	of	similar	doctrines	by	other	national	Courts.	

For	each	case,	all	 the	relevant	 formants	 (Sacco,	1991)	are	considered:	constitutional	clauses	
on	constitutional	amendments’	limits;	doctrinal	reconstructions	of	those	limits	and	scholarship	on	
the	 corresponding	 role	 of	 the	 Courts;	 finally,	 domestic	 case	 law.	 In	 particular,	 the	 arguments	
employed	by	Courts	in	order	to	justify	their	own	intervention,	as	well	as	the	scope	of	the	yardstick	
used	in	the	review	are	critically	assessed.	

Overall,	the	paper	aims	to	prove	three	main	assumptions	through	the	comparative	analysis:	
	
1. that	the	yardstick	used	in	the	adjudication	on	constitutional	amendments	only	consists	of	

the	 “basic	 structure”	 or	 basic/fundamental	 /supreme	 principles	 or	 identity	 of	 the	
constitution,	needing	to	be	kept	separate	from	the	yardstick	employed	in	ordinary	judicial	
review	of	legislation;	

2. that	 that	yardstick,	differently	named	 in	each	 legal	 system,	can	always	be	 related	 to	 the	
concept	of	“democracy”,	although	just	sometimes	it	 is	explicitly	phrased	and	labeled	this	
way,	especially	with	reference	to	the	separation	of	powers;	

3. that	 the	 identification	 of	 the	 “basic	 structure”	 is	 devoted	mainly	 to	 judicial	 elaboration,	
even	 for	 those	 countries	 whose	 constitution	 contains	 explicit	 clauses	 limiting	 the	
amending	power.	

	

																																																													
2	See	the	leading	case	Kesavananda	Bharati	v.	State	of	Kerala	and	Another	(1973)	4	SCC	225,	in	which	this	expression	is	used	for	
the	first	time.			
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The	paper	emphasizes	the	migration	and	diffusion	of	the	concept	of	“basic	structure”	 in	the	
selected	 case	 studies,	 inferring	 ideas	 from	 the	 comparative	 analysis	 in	 order	 to	 assess	 to	 what	
extent	 there	has	been	 circulation	of	 arguments	 and	 ideas,	 in	 particular	within	 Europe	 and	 Latin	
America.	Focusing	on	these	two	areas	will	enrich	the	debates	on	contemporary	legal	comparison	
and	potential	global	scholarship,	proposing	original	conclusions,	drawing	 inspiration	 from	on	the	
Indian	doctrine	and	the	other	comparable	doctrines.	

	
Constitutional	 courts	 justifying	 their	 role	 in	 safeguarding	 the	basic	
structure	of	the	Constitution	
	

Constitutional	 adjudication	 on	 constitutional	 amendments	 differs	 from	 the	 control	 of	
legislation	 not	 from	 the	 subjective	 point	 of	 view	 (as	 the	 subjects	 involved	 are	 normally	 the	
Constitutional/Supreme	Court	and	the	legislator	as	it	happens	with	ordinary	legislation)	but	from	
the	objective	perspective.	The	object	of	the	control	is	represented	by	hierarchically	higher	norms,	
endowed	with	 the	 force	 to	modify,	by	means	of	a	 change,	addition	or	abrogation,	a	part	of	 the	
constitution.	

The	procedure	for	passing	such	norms	is	different	from	the	one	to	be	used	to	adopt	ordinary	
legislation,	 generally	 requiring	 a	 higher	 majority/consensus	 or	 additional	 forms	 of	 procedural	
complexity.	Such	sources	are	still	an	expression	of	a	constituted	power,	regulated	and	limited	by	
the	 constitution	 itself,	 independently	 from	 the	 various	 denominations	 attributed	 to	 it	 (for	
example,	in	Latin	America,	expressions	like	poder	constituyente	derivado	are	common).	

Additionally,	 if	the	object	of	control	 is	not	an	ordinary	law,	nor	is	 it	the	original	constitution,	
i.e.	the	outcome	of	the	work	of	the	constituent	power.	

The	 number	 of	 cases	 that	 prove	 this	 point	 is	 wide.	 One	 can	 recall	 the	 judgments	 by	 the	
Chilean	Constitutional	Court	on	its	lack	of	jurisdiction	concerning	the	constitutionality	of	the	1980	
constitution	(Judgments	n.	46,	21/12/1987	and	n.	272,	18/3/1998);	the	first	decisions	by	the	
Constitutional	 Chamber	 of	 the	 Supreme	 Court	 of	 Costa	 Rica	 (Judgments	 1-92	 and	 2-92),	 as	
well	 as	 the	 judgments	 by	 the	Mexican	 Supreme	 Court	 in	 the	 case	Manuel	 Camacho	 Solís	 v.	
Congress	of	the	Union	and	others	(Judgment	on	the	“Amparo	en	revisión”	1334/1998).	In	these	
judgments,	 a	 specific	 philosophical	 argument	 is	 (at	 least	 implicitly)	 employed,	 namely	 the	
apagogical	 argument	 or	 reductio	 ad	 absurdum:	 if	 the	 source	 of	 law	 that	 established	 the	
corresponding	Court	were	to	be	struck	down,	consequently	also	the	decision	taken	by	the	Court	
itself	would	lack	legitimacy.	

The	 exception	 to	 this	 trend	 is	 shown	 by	 the	 judgment	 adopted	 on	 April	 22,	 2015	 by	 the	
Constitutional	 Chamber	 of	 the	 Honduran	 Supreme	 Court	 (Landau,	 Dixon,	 Roznai,	 2019).	 In	 that	
decision,	 in	fact,	the	original	unamendable	provision	included	in	the	1982	Honduran	constitution	
concerning	presidential	re-election	was	struck	down.	

With	 the	 exclusion	 of	 this	 case,	 comparative	 case	 law	 shows	 the	 intention	 to	 differentiate	
between	 the	norms	 contained	 in	 the	original	 constitution	 and	 the	 amendments,	 as	Courts	 treat	
them,	 in	 the	 first	 case,	 as	 parts	 of	 the	original	 source	 and,	 in	 the	 second,	 as	 “derived”	 sources,	
outcome	of	the	exercise	of	a	constituted	power.	

Different	arguments	have	been	used	by	Courts	in	order	to	justify	their	check	on	constitutional	
amendments.	 I	am	 inclined	to	classify	 them	through	a	 threefold	partition	 (Ragone,	2013):	a)	 the	
existence	of	eternity	clauses	postulates	a	control	over	their	respect;	b)	constitutional	amendments	
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are	 hierarchically	 lower	with	 respect	 to	 constitutional	 fundamental	 principles;	 c)	 judicial	 review	
represents	one	of	the	elements	of	the	“basic	structure”	as	such	(as	it	is	in	the	Indian	case).	

Concerning	 the	 reasoning	 sub	 a),	 the	 German	 case	 is	 of	 great	 interest:	 the	 constitution	
contains	 in	 Article	 79	 an	 eternity	 clause	 that	 forbids	 that	 the	 organization	 of	 the	 Federation	 in	
Länder	 be	 modified,	 as	 well	 as	 their	 participation	 in	 the	 legislative	 activity	 and	 the	 principles	
established	 in	 Articles	 1	 and	 20	 of	 the	 constitution	 (Lücke,	 2007).	 The	 irreformable	 aspects	 are	
essentially	 related	 to	 two	areas,	 federalism	and	the	protection	of	human	rights.	The	set	of	 rules	
that	determine	 the	 “constitutional	 identity”	 include	human	dignity,	 inviolable	human	 rights,	 the	
obligation	of	public	powers	to	respect	and	implement	such	rights	-	Article	1	-	and	the	configuration	
of	the	State	as	federal,	social,	democratic	and	based	on	the	rule	of	law	-	Article	20	-	(Hain,	1999;	
Heun,	2011).	

The	 Federal	 Constitutional	 Court	 has	 repeatedly	 affirmed	 that	 it	 is	 authorized	 to	 verify	 the	
consistency	 of	 constitutional	 amendments	 with	 those	 clauses.	 The	 most	 known	 case	 occurred	
after	the	reform	of	the	regulation	of	telephone	tapping	(so-called	G-10	Gesetz),	which	was	legally	
permitted	since	1968,	diminishing	privacy	and	secrecy	of	communications.	The	tapping	was	carried	
out	without	the	 intercepted	being	 informed	and	was	ordered	and	supervised	by	a	parliamentary	
commission,	 without	 any	 judicial	 intervention.	 The	 Federal	 Constitutional	 Court	 did	 not	 strike	
down	 the	 reform,	 framing	 it	 as	 an	 exception	 connected	 to	 an	 extraordinary	 situation	 (BVerfGE	
30,1,	1970).	

There	were	 some	 subsequent	 cases,	 such	 as	 the	 reform	 of	 political	 asylum	 (1993)	 and	 the	
changes	to	the	surveillance	on	suspects	of	serious	crimes	(1998),	which	also	were	not	considered	
contrary	to	the	core	of	human	rights	(BVerfGE	109,	279,	2004).	Again,	the	Court	considered	that	
these	were	 proportionate	 tools	 with	 respect	 to	 the	 public	 interest	 pursued,	 and	 they	 provided	
sufficient	guarantees	(Leisner,	1999;	Palermo,	2008).	

Another	decision	was	adopted	concerning	the	amendment	that	followed	the	reunification	of	
the	country:	Article	143	established	that	people	whose	property	had	been	expropriated	between	
1945	 and	 1949	 (i.e.	 during	 the	 Soviet	 occupation)	 were	 not	 entitled	 to	 any	 restitution.	 Several	
affected	individuals	filed	individual	complaints	(so-called	Verfassungsbeschwerde),	but	the	Federal	
Constitutional	Court	found	that	the	reform	did	not	affect	the	right	of	property,	because	the	norm	
referred	 to	 expropriations	 accepted	 by	 international	 legal	 standards	 and	 enforced	 before	 the	
constitution	itself	had	entered	into	force	(see	BVerfGE	84,90,	1991,	and	also	BVerfGE	94,12,	1996).	

In	general,	in	the	German	case,	the	existence	of	the	eternity	clause	proved	essential,	because	
it	 was	 used	 to	 support	 the	 intervention	 of	 the	 Court	 as	 the	 defender	 of	 the	 identity	 of	 the	
constitution.	Otherwise,	the	only	protection	of	the	constitution	would	be	the	will	and	good	faith	of	
political	 actors.	 In	 light	 of	 the	 consistent	 jurisprudence	 and	 the	 lack	 of	 significant	 opposite	
theorizations,	 scholarly	works	 have	 focused	 on	 the	 eternity	 clause	 and	 the	 concrete	 judgments	
more	than	the	analysis	of	the	theoretical-general	scope	of	the	question	(Pfersmann,	1993).	

Concerning	 the	 argument	 sub	 b),	 the	 assimilation	 (to	 a	 certain	 extent)	 of	 constitutional	
amendments	to	ordinary	legislation	has	been	employed	to	affirm	that	constitutional	adjudication	
on	amendments	derives	logically	from	the	hierarchy	of	norms.	The	idea	is	that	all	amendments	are	
subordinate	 to	 the	constitution	as	 they	are	regulated	and	 limited	by	 it,	although	the	yardstick	 is	
more	restricted	in	comparison	with	the	one	that	has	to	be	used	for	ordinary	legislation,	covering	
exclusively	the	supreme	principles	or	the	basic	structure.	

The	 empirical	 analysis	 proves	 that	 no	 reasoning	 is	 based	 exclusively	 on	 just	 one	 of	 the	
arguments,	but	some	Courts	have	relied	mainly	on	this	thesis	(Ragone,	2012).	
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In	 Italy,	 the	 first	decisions	 in	which	 the	Constitutional	Court	elaborated	a	 sort	of	division	of	
constitutional	norms	according	to	their	hierarchical	value	were	related	to	canon	law	and	European	
law.	When	establishing	 the	 limits	 of	 these	 two	 sets	 of	 norms	when	 they	merge	with	 the	 Italian	
legal	 system,	 the	 Constitutional	 Court	 held	 that	 they	 could	 not	 violate	 certain	 constitutional	
principles	(while	they	generally	prevail	over	other	provisions)3.	

Later,	 also	 recalling	 these	 previous	 judgments,	 the	 Court	 identified	 an	 unchangeable	 hard	
core,	 which	 is	 composed	 by	 both	 the	 explicit	 eternity	 clause	 of	 the	 constitution	 (Article	 139,	
according	 to	 which	 the	 Republican	 form	 of	 State	 shall	 not	 be	 a	 matter	 for	 constitutional	
amendment)	 and	 other	 supreme	 principles	 that	 define	 its	 identity.	 Judgment	 n.	 1146/1988	
represented	the	point	of	departure	of	this	doctrine.	Replying	to	the	question	raised	by	the	judge	of	
the	specific	case,	the	Court	stated	that	“the	Italian	constitution	contains	some	supreme	principles	
that	cannot	be	subverted	nor	modified	in	their	essential	content,	not	even	through	constitutional	
amendments	 or	 other	 constitutional	 laws”.	 These	 are	 the	 principles	 that	 the	 constitution	 itself	
explicitly	 fixes	as	 limits	 to	 the	amending	power,	 such	as	 the	Republican	 form	-	Article	139	 -,	but	
also	 the	 principles	 that,	 despite	 not	 being	 expressly	 mentioned	 among	 those	 norms	 that	 are	
exempted	 from	 constitutional	 amendment	 procedures,	 belong	 to	 the	 essence	 of	 the	 supreme	
values	on	which	 the	 Italian	constitution	 is	based.	Once	clarified	 that	certain	elements	cannot	be	
eliminated,	the	Constitutional	Court	attributed	to	itself	the	task	to	verify	the	constitutionality	of	all	
sources	of	constitutional	rank,	because	“if	it	were	not	so,	the	absurd	consequence	would	be	that	
the	mechanisms	of	judicial	protection	of	the	constitution	would	be	ineffective,	precisely	in	relation	
to	 the	 norms	 with	 the	 higher	 rank”	 (which	 means,	 constitutional	 norms	 contained	 either	 in	
amendments	or	constitutional	laws	-	i.e.	laws	that	must	be	passed	through	the	same	procedure	as	
amendments,	but	they	do	not	directly	change	the	text	of	the	constitution).	

The	 conclusion	 of	 the	 argument	 was	 clear-cut:	 if	 there	 were	 no	 supervisor	 of	 the	
amendments,	precisely	those	norms	potentially	able	to	truly	affect	the	fundamental	values	of	the	
constitutional	system	would	be	exempt	 from	any	control.	The	 first	 relevant	element	of	 this	case	
law	 is	 that	 the	express	 limit	 to	 the	amendments	 (the	Republic)	 is	not	 the	only	one,	as	 there	are	
other	 irreformable	principles,	which	are	 those	 that	exemplify	 the	 supreme	values	of	 the	 system	
and	 also	 by	 fundamental	 rights,	 at	 least	 with	 reference	 to	 their	 essential	 content	 (see	 the	
evolution	of	the	scholarship	in	Italy:	Barile,	1967;	Barile,	De	Siervo,	1968;	Reposo,	1972;	Mortati,	
1952;	Luciani,	1992;	Ripepe,	Romboli,	1995;	Romboli,	1996;	Ruggeri,	2000;	Pegoraro,	Ferioli,	2000;	
Guastini,	2003;	Ruggeri,	2005;	Gambino,	2007).	

	
The	 Yardstick	 in	 Constitutional	 Adjudication	 on	 Constitutional	
Amendments:	a	Variously	called	“Basic	Structure”	–	or	“Identity”	
	

There	 is	an	additional	 -	and	more	relevant,	 in	my	opinion	 -	objective	aspect	 that	proves	 the	
distinction	 with	 respect	 to	 constitutional	 adjudication	 on	 ordinary	 legislation,	 which	 is	 the	
yardstick	(Ragone,	2012).	

First,	the	yardstick	used	by	Courts	to	check	the	constitutionality	of	amendments	is	necessarily	
“narrower”.	If	it	was	not	so,	every	amendment	would	be	contrary	to	the	constitution	as	long	as	it	
is	changing	 it.	This	corollary	may	not	be	true	exclusively	 for	additions	through	amendments,	but	
still	the	result	would	be	absurd.		

																																																													
3	 On	 canon	 law,	 see	 judgments	 n.	 30/1971,	 n.	 12/1972,	 n.	 175/1973	 and	 n.	 1/1977.	 On	 European	 law,	 see	 judgments	 n.	
183/1973,	n.	170/1984	and	n.	232/1989.	
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As	a	consequence,	Courts	have	to	select	which	violations	actually	lead	to	a	change	of	the	basic	
structure	of	the	constitution.	This	implies	that	the	constitution	cannot	be	represented	(anymore)	
as	a	series	of	norms	with	the	exact	some	value,	as	a	necessity	arises	to	distinguish	between	them	
in	 order	 to	 understand	 which	 ones	 are	 so	 fundamental	 that	 they	 cannot	 be	 subject	 to	
amendments	(Ragone,	2012;	Roznai,	2017).	

From	this	perspective,	constitutions	carry	principles	and	values,	which	altogether	determine	
their	 “basic	 structure”	or	“identity”.	A	 reform,	which,	even	qualifying	as	 such,	had	an	 impact	on	
these	aspects,	should	be	considered	as	the	establishment	of	a	new	constitutional	order,	that	is,	a	
replacement	of	 the	 constitution	as	 the	Colombian	Constitutional	Court	would	name	 it.	 The	 case	
law	of	this	Court	represents	an	excellent	example	of	this	doctrinal	construction.	

The	Colombian	constitution	of	1991,	in	fact,	provides	the	Constitutional	Court	with	the	power	
of	 adjudicating	 on	 the	 so-called	 legislative	 acts,	 which	 are	 constitutional	 amendments	 (Article	
241).	 More	 in	 general,	 this	 Article	 states	 that	 the	 Constitutional	 Court	 is	 given	 the	 task	 of	
safeguarding	the	 integrity	and	supremacy	of	 the	constitution,	also	 through	 individual	complaints	
brought	 against	 constitutional	 reforms	 by	 any	 citizen.	 Constitutional	 adjudication	 of	 the	
amendments	can	be	performed,	only	on	procedural	grounds	(“vices	related	to	the	formation”	of	
the	act),	independently	from	the	procedure	adopted	to	pass	them.	

The	 same	 Article	 241	 also	 regulates	 the	 power	 of	 the	 Constitutional	 Court	 to	 adjudicate	 a	
priori	 on	 the	 constitutionality	of	 the	 call	 for	 referendum	or	 constituent	Assembly,	 again	only	on	
procedural	 grounds.	 This	 power	 is	 exercised	 automatically,	 with	 no	 need	 for	 any	 specific	
complaint,	 and	 the	 judgment	 constitutes	 res	 iudicata.	 The	 mandate	 of	 the	 Court	 is	 further	
specified	by	Article	379.	

In	the	first	cases,	decided	in	1997,	the	Court	affirmed	that	its	check	would	only	comprehend	
the	verification	of	the	respect	of	all	the	steps	to	be	followed	in	the	special	amending	procedure.	
Also,	 judgment	 C-543/1998	 confirmed	 such	 position,	 because	 this	 kind	 of	 “constitutional	
adjudication	 affect[ed]	 the	 amending	 procedure	 and	 not	 on	 the	 substance	 of	 the	 amendment”.	
The	last	judgment	that	consistently	respected	this	reasoning	was	C-487/2002,	in	which	the	Court	
again	declared	lacking	jurisdiction	on	potential	substantial	vices.	

The	 judgment	 that	 inaugurated	 the	 new	 approach	 of	 the	 Court,	 which	 is	 relevant	 for	 this	
paper,	 was	 C-551/2003,	 in	 which	 law	 n.	 796/2003	 (calling	 for	 a	 referendum	 to	 amend	 the	
constitution)	was	challenged	before	the	Court.	That	 judgment	 is	 the	 leading	case	concerning	the	
replacement	doctrine	as	a	consequence	of	the	conception	of	the	amending	power	as	constituted	-	
opposed	 to	 the	 original	 constituent	 power	 (see	 in	 particular	 Osuna	 Patiño,	 2004;	 Morelli	 Rico,	
2005;	Vila	Casado,	2007;	Cepeda	Espinosa,	Landau,	2017).	

With	 this	 judgment,	 the	 Court	 initiated	 a	 line	 of	 jurisprudence	 which	 remained	 consistent	
throughout	the	posterior	activity.	It	is	based	on	an	interpretation	of	the	procedure,	so	wide	as	to	
comprise	even	what	has	been	denominated	“vice	of	competence”.	Through	creative	hermeneutics,	
the	Court	argues	that	Article	241	enables	 it	 to	verify	whether	the	Congress,	when	amending	the	
constitution,	 was	 acting	 within	 its	 powers	 (=competence)	 or	 not.	 In	 other	 words,	 when	 the	
Congress	 is	 not	 amending,	 but	 replacing	 the	 constitution,	 it	 is	 exercising	 a	 power	 that	 belongs	
exclusively	to	the	original	constituent	power,	that	is,	to	the	people.	

In	the	words	of	the	Court,	the	amending	procedure	entails	the	possibility	of	modifying	certain	
aspects	 of	 the	 constitution,	but	 not	 its	 fundamental	 elements	 nor	 its	 basis,	 and	 consequently,	 it	
does	 not	 imply	 the	 possibility	 of	 replacing	 it.	 Should	 the	 Congress	 go	 beyond	 the	 limits	 of	 the	
amending	 power,	 there	 would	 be	 a	 procedural	 vice	 even	 if	 the	 constitution	 of	 1991	 does	 not	
contain	 any	explicit	 eternity	 clauses.	 In	 this	 respect,	 the	Court	 ruled	 that	 the	 subsistence	of	 the	
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competence	 of	 the	 body	 amending	 the	 constitution	 is	 a	 procedural	 matter,	 and	 therefore	
represents	a	potential	yardstick	 for	constitutional	adjudication	on	amendments	according	 to	 the	
aforementioned	Article	241.	

It	was	(and	still	is)	not	clear	which	the	exact	elements	are	that	may	lead	to	the	replacement,	
as	the	Court	just	gave	some	examples	in	this	first	judgment,	such	as	the	hypothetical	replacement	
of	the	democratic,	republican	and	social	form	of	State	based	on	the	rule	of	law	with	a	dictatorship,	
a	monarchy	 or	 a	 totalitarian	 State.	 Throughout	 its	 jurisprudence,	 the	 principles	 that	 have	 been	
considered	 essential	 span	 from	 truly	 paramount	 values,	 such	 as	 democracy,	 to	 relatively	minor	
issues	such	as	the	requirements	to	become	public	officers.	

The	later	judgment	C-1200/2003,	concerning	legislative	act	n.	3/2002	(a	reform	of	the	criminal	
procedural	 code),	 was	 the	 first	 one	 in	 which	 the	 approach	 adopted	 in	 C-551/2003	 was	 further	
pursued.	Differently	 from	the	previous	case,	 it	was	a	case	falling	under	Article	241	n.	1,	and	this	
proved	 that	 the	 Court	 would	 use	 the	 replacement	 doctrine	 for	 any	 kind	 of	 amendment	
independently	 from	 the	 procedure	 used	 to	 pass	 it.	 In	 point	 3,	 the	 Court	 specified	 that	 the	
replacement	cannot	be	understood	as	an	amendment	substituting	the	constitution	from	a	strictly	
formal	 perspective;	 in	 fact,	 the	 change	 must	 be	 of	 such	 magnitude,	 that	 it	 transforms	 the	
constitution	 into	a	completely	different	one.	This	magnitude	does	not	depend	on	the	number	of	
clauses	affected	but	on	the	relevance	of	the	part/parts	amended.	

Again	and	again,	the	Court	denied	performing	a	substantial	control.	In	judgment	C-668/2004,	
for	instance,	 it	stated	that	it	would	not	evaluate	a	potential	violation	of	the	principle	of	equality,	
because	that	would	result	 in	a	check	on	the	merits	of	the	amendment	which	 is	 forbidden	to	the	
Court	and	would	distort	the	logic	of	constitutional	adjudication	itself.	

In	two	judgments	of	2004	(C-970	and	C-971)	the	Court	partially	clarified	the	method	it	would	
follow	when	adjudicating	on	constitutional	reforms,	elaborating	on	the	substitution/replacement	
test	 divided	 into	 three	 steps.	 First,	 the	 essential	 element	 of	 the	 constitution	 which	 has	 been	
replaced	 needs	 to	 be	 identified,	 specifying	 its	 constitutional	 configuration	 through	 multiple	
clauses.	In	fact,	to	prove	that	the	element	is	essential	one	shall	preferably	find	it	in	several	articles,	
as	 there	 are	 no	 eternity	 clauses.	 In	 the	 judgement	 of	 contrast	 or	 verification,	 the	 Court	 has	 to	
establish	 whether	 the	 essential	 element	 was	 replaced	 by	 another	 one	 and	 whether	 the	 new	
element	is	so	distinct	as	to	be	incompatible	with	the	constitutional	identity	(Ramírez	Cleves,	2006;	
Quince	Ramírez,	2006;	Quince	Ramírez,	2008;	Bernal	Pulido,	2013).	

Later	 on,	 the	 replacement	 doctrine	 has	 been	 applied	 to	 highly	 politicized	 issues,	 from	 the	
reelection	 of	 the	 President4	 to	 the	 recent	 peace	 process5.	 This	 doctrine	 of	 the	 Colombian	
Constitutional	 Court	 has	 triggered	 any	 kind	 of	 reactions	 in	 scholarship	 and	 public	 opinion,	
spanning	from	endorsement	and	admiration	to	strong	criticism	toward	the	activism	of	the	Court.	

A	few	scholars	have	argued	that	the	Court	exercised	a	power	that	it	did	not	have,	abusing	its	
role	 in	the	system	and	lacking	democratic	 legitimacy,	or	have	examined	specific	cases	to	prove	a	
misuse	of	 the	 replacement	doctrine	both	as	a	 too	broad	and	 (more	 rarely)	 too	narrow	concept.	
The	main	 arguments	 brought	 about	 against	 the	 doctrine	 are	 textual	 and	 are	 based,	 on	 the	 one	
hand,	on	the	absence	of	any	eternity	clause	in	the	constitution	and,	on	the	other	hand,	on	Article	
241	and	its	express	reference	to	procedural	grounds.	Also,	the	use	of	the	doctrine	by	the	Court	has	
been	 considered	 as	 an	 example	 of	 judicial	 activism	 and	 (too)	 extensive	 interpretation	 of	 its	

																																																													
4	Judgments	C-1040/2005	to	C-1057/2005	and	then	C-141/2010.	
5	For	instance,	Judgment	C-332/2017	(on	which	see	Ragone,	2017).	
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functions,	particularly	because	it	disposes	of	a	notable	margin	of	maneuver	when	deciding	what	is	
subject	or	not	to	constitutional	change.	

The	 main	 arguments	 in	 favor	 of	 the	 replacement	 doctrine	 are	 based	 on	 the	 needs	 for	 a	
common	 ethical	 ground;	 for	 the	 prevention	 of	 abuses	 by	 political	 power;	 for	 the	 protection	 of	
fundamental	rights	and	basic	principles	-	in	particular,	the	separation	of	powers	in	the	context	of	a	
hyperpresidentialism	-	that	define	the	identity	of	the	constitution	and	the	violation	of	which	would	
be	a	breach	of	the	system	itself	(Ramírez	Cleves,	2016;	Guastini,	2017).	

	
The	Elaboration	of	 the	Yardstick	 for	Adjudication	on	Constitutional	
Amendments	
	

The	yardstick	comprises	the	norms	on	how	to	pass	constitutional	amendment	(unless	they	are	
the	 object	 of	 the	 amendment,	 obviously),	 plus	 the	 eternity	 clauses	 included	 in	 the	 constitution	
(like	in	the	German	or	Italian	case,	but	also	other	cases).	

The	idea	of	the	existence	of	an	irreformable	core	has	been	supported	by	many	authors	over	
the	decades:	one	can	think	of	W.L.	Marbury,	who	referred	to	the	express	prohibition	of	the	reform	
of	equal	representation	of	the	States	in	the	Senate	of	the	United	States	to	endorse	constitutional	
adjudication	checking	the	fulfilment	of	the	hard	core	of	the	constitution	(Marbury,	1919-20);	W.F.	
Murphy	 relied	 on	 the	 meaning	 of	 the	 verb	 “to	 amend”,	 in	 which	 a	 total	 modification	 of	 the	
fundamental	Charter	could	not	be	contained	(Murphy,	1995).	One	can	also	recall	M.	de	la	Cueva,	
which	referred	to	the	supreme	principles	of	legal	certainty	and	judicial	control	of	acts	adopted	by	
public	authorities,	alongside	the	necessary	existence	of	individual	complaints	(de	la	Cueva,	1982).	
I.	 Burgoa	 Orihuela	 (1985)	 also	 argued	 that	 there	 are	 essential	 elements	 that	 represent	 the	
fundamental	 political	 decisions	 of	 the	 people.	 The	 Italian	 doctrine	 has	 widely	 endorsed	 the	
existence	 of	 substantial	 limits	 that	 are	 found	 in	 the	 supreme	 principles,	 and	 the	 Constitutional	
Court	 adopted	 this	 position,	 as	 outlined	 above.	 The	 same	did	 the	 Peruvian	 Constitutional	 Court	
with	reference	to	dignity,	equality,	right	to	life,	popular	sovereignty	and	the	rule	of	law6.	

These	 theorists	and	Courts	went	 in	 the	same	direction	as	 the	 Indian	and	South	African	case	
law	based	on	the	idea	of	a	complex	of	principles	and	values	that	determine	the	“basic	structure”	of	
the	constitution	and	consequently	are	irreformable.	

In	South	Africa,	the	first	case	decided	with	respect	to	this	issue	focused	on	the	reform	of	the	
1993	Transitional	constitution,	made	through	the	Second	Amendment	Act,	n.	44	of	1995	(the	1995	
constitutional	amendment),	in	relation	to	Articles	149,	182,	184	and	245	of	the	constitution.	With	
that	 ruling,	 the	 Court	 clarified	 that	 a	 reform	 contrary	 to	 a	 constitutional	 clause	 represents	 a	
“physiological”	 hypothesis	 (otherwise	 it	 would	 not	 be	 a	 reform),	 provided	 that	 it	 is	 adopted	
respecting	 the	 necessary	 procedure7.	 Nevertheless,	 after	 dealing	 with	 the	 procedural	
requirements,	 the	 Court	 addressed	 a	 more	 complex	 issue,	 that	 is,	 the	 existence	 or	 not	 of	 a	
constitutional	“spirit”	to	which	reference	should	be	made	in	order	to	assess	the	legitimacy	of	the	
reform,	 even	 in	 the	 absence	 of	 formal	 vices.	 The	 judges	 affirmed	 that	 an	 amendment,	 formally	
valid,	 that	 implied	 a	 radical	 restructuring	 of	 the	 fundamentals	 of	 the	 constitution,	 could	 not	 be	

																																																													
6	Cases	n.	014-2002-AI/TC;	n.	0006-2003-AI/TC;	n.	014-2003-AI/TC;	n.	050-2004-AI/TC.	On	these	cases,	see	Bernales	Ballesteros	
(2005),	García	Belaunde	(2006)	Eto	Cruz	(2009).	
7	 Judgment	CCT	36/95:	 “it	may	perhaps	be	 that	 a	purported	amendment	 to	 the	Constitution,	 following	 the	 formal	procedures	
prescribed	by	the	Constitution,	but	radically	and	fundamentally	restructuring	and	re-organizing	the	fundamental	premises	of	the	
Constitution,	might	not	qualify	as	an	 ‘amendment’	at	all”.	For	a	 comprehensive	 introduction	 to	constitutional	 interpretation	 in	
South	Africa,	see	Fowkes	(2016).	
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considered	 an	 amendment	 stricto	 sensu;	 in	 addition,	 the	 Court	 implicitly	 reserved	 for	 itself	 the	
power	to	assess	when	an	amendment	“abrogates	or	destroys	the	constitution”	(Sarkin,	1997).	

This	 position	 was	 confirmed	 and	 broadened	 in	 posterior	 jurisprudence,	 starting	 with	 CCT	
23/02,	 in	 which	 the	 Court	 ratified	 two	 pillars	 of	 its	 own	 function:	 an	 amendment	 that	 would	
undermine	the	basic	structure	of	the	constitution	could	not	be	considered	as	a	proper	application	
of	 the	 amending	 power	 regulated	 by	 Article	 74	 of	 the	 constitution;	 similarly,	 a	modification	 of	
founding	values	 set	out	 in	 section	1	could	be	done	exclusively	 respecting	 the	specific	procedure	
established	by	the	constitution	(there	are	therefore	no	limits).	Later	on,	the	Court	referred	to	the	
set	of	targets	 indicated	 in	the	preamble	of	the	constitution,	that	 is,	the	construction	of	a	society	
based	on	democracy	and	social	 justice,	as	well	as	a	system	of	government	based	on	the	popular	
will.	In	the	same	context,	the	Court	explained	some	of	the	founding	values:	human	dignity,	party	
pluralism,	 alongside	 a	 democratic,	 representative	 and	 participative	 order	 that	 guarantees	
accountability,	responsiveness	and	openness8.	

The	denominations	given	 to	unamendable	principles	by	Constitutional	Courts,	 in	addition	 to	
concepts	 like	 identity,	basic	structure	and	the	supreme	principles,	also	 include	the	“spirit”	of	the	
constitution	and	the	“fundamental	political	decisions”.		

The	 real	 issue	 becomes	 precisely	 the	 determination	 of	 the	 principles	 that	 reflect	 such	
fundamental	decisions.	

In	 the	 light	 of	 the	 comparative	 research	 I	 have	 carried	 out	 over	 the	 past	 decade,	 trying	 to	
extrapolate	 which	 elements	 compose	 the	 specific	 yardstick	 identifiable	 as	 identity	 or	 basic	
structure,	 a	 bottom-up	 perspective	 is	 to	 be	 preferred.	 The	 advantages	 of	 such	 perspective	 are	
twofold:	on	 the	one	hand,	 this	approach	values	 the	 role	of	Constitutional	Courts	when	 they	are	
obliged	to	use	and/or	create	notions	of	general	theory;	and	on	the	other	hand,	the	basic	structure	
determined	 in	 this	 way	 does	 not	 represent	 a	 pre-conception,	 but	 rather	 leads	 to	
phenomenological,	empirical	data.	

It	 seems	 to	 me	 that	 all	 the	 limits	 to	 constitutional	 amendments,	 regardless	 of	 their	
denomination,	somehow	relate	to	the	same	concept,	that	 is,	the	form	of	State	 in	a	broad	sense:	
the	value	always	referred	to,	as	a	matter	of	fact,	is	democracy,	followed	by	its	corollaries	such	as	
popular	sovereignty,	pluralism,	separation	of	powers	and	fundamental	rights.	To	these	concepts,	
the	 legal	 systems	 add	 specifications	 connected	 with	 their	 own	 fundamental	 principles.	 In	 my	
opinion,	 all	 the	 various	 aspects	 at	 stake,	 that	 is,	 the	 guarantee	 of	 rights,	 popular	 sovereignty,	
pluralism	 and	 the	 separation	 of	 powers	 coagulate	 around	 democracy.	 However,	 for	 this	
construction	 to	 be	 maintained,	 a	 further	 corollary	 is	 necessary:	 constitutional	 supremacy	 (a	
principle	 mentioned	 to	 sustain	 its	 own	 role	 by	 a	 large	 part	 of	 jurisprudence9),	 which	 ensures	
continuity	and	stability	in	the	system	and	is	logically	related	to	all	elements	already	mentioned.	

	
The	 Scope	 of	 the	 Principles	 of	 the	 “Basic	 Structure”	 of	 the	
Constitution:	Comparative	Conclusions	
	

When	 it	 comes	 to	 the	 scope	 of	 the	 yardstick,	 recalling	 what	 Italian,	 German	 and	 Peruvian	
jurisprudence	 (but	 not	 only	 these	 ones)	 affirmed	 about	 rights,	 it	 seems	 necessary	 to	 recall	 and	

																																																													
8	See	Matatiele	Municipality	and	others	versus	President	of	 the	Republic	of	South	Africa	and	others	 (27th	February	2006),	 so-
called	Matatiele	 I	 and	 also	 CCT	 73/05,	 judgment	Matatiele	Municipality	 and	 others	 versus	 President	 of	 the	Republic	 of	 South	
Africa	and	others	(18th	of	August,	2006),	so-called	Matatiele	II.	
9	 One	 can	 find	 this	 reference	 in	 the	 Argentinian	 case	 Fayt	 (1999);	 as	 well	 as	 in	 judgment	 C-551/2003	 of	 the	 Colombian	
Constitutional	Court	or	980-91	of	the	Costa	Rican	Court.	
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reiterate	that	all	principles	assumed	as	yardsticks	of	the	constitutionality	of	amendments,	as	the	
extrema	 ratio,	 have	 to	 be	 interpreted	 restrictively,	 that	 is,	 in	 their	 essential	 content.	 In	 other	
words,	what	the	amending	power	cannot	do	is	to	eliminate	one	element	of	the	basic	structure	of	
the	constitutional	order,	but	 it	 is	not	 forbidden	 to	perform	certain	 “reasonable”	variations.	As	a	
consequence,	 the	norms	 to	be	 looked	at	as	yardsticks	are	 restricted	 to	 the	minimum	content	of	
the	corresponding	fundamental	rights	or	basic	principles.	

Of	 course,	 these	 principles	 are	 broad	 enough	 to	 become	 at	 least	 partially	 unstable	 and	
undergo	modifications,	as	they	are	applied	in	changing	societies.	In	this	context,	the	interpretation	
of	every	value	performed	by	Constitutional	Courts	is	essential.	Such	a	function,	of	course,	cannot	
be	exercised	with	total	discretion	on	the	part	of	constitutional	judges,	who	may	create	and	adapt	
the	yardstick,	while	being	called	to	interpret	the	norms	taking	into	account	the	principles	already	
present	 in	 the	 constitution.	 This	 exegetical	 operation	 does	 not	 imply	 usurpation	 of	 political	
powers,	 but	 the	 exercise	 of	 the	 interpretational	 role	 of	 Courts,	 as	 long	 as	 it	 is	 performed	with	
sufficient	self-restraint.	

As	it	was	previously	recalled,	in	my	research	I	have	taken	into	account	the	contribution	that	all	
“formants”	 give	 to	 the	 configuration	 of	 the	 yardstick.	 Basically,	 in	 all	 jurisdictions	 there	 is	 a	
prevalence	of	the	case	law,	in	many	cases	endorsed	or	preceded	by	consistent	scholarship.	

Such	 a	 result	 was	 foreseeable	 in	 those	 systems	 in	 which	 constitutional	 adjudication	 of	
amendments	 was	 claimed	 by	 the	 corresponding	 Court	 and	 not	 expressly	 allotted	 to	 it	 by	 the	
constitution;	nevertheless,	the	same	can	be	said	about	the	other	 legal	systems	analyzed.	Even	in	
the	presence	of	explicit	norms,	more	or	less	specific	and	detailed,	the	greatest	creator	of	the	rules	
(especially	in	relation	to	the	yardstick	and	its	scope)	are	Constitutional/Supreme	Courts.	

Many	 Courts	 have	 tried	 (and	 still	 try)	 to	 defend	 the	 idea	 according	 to	which	 the	 amending	
power	 given	 to	 the	 Parliament	 is	 a	 limited	 power,	 directed	 mainly	 to	 “constitutional	
maintenance”.	 So	 did	 the	 Colombian	 Constitutional	 Court	 and	 the	 Italian	 one	 in	 the	
abovementioned	 case	 law.	 But	 also,	 in	 judgment	 Fayt	 (1999),	 the	 Argentinian	 Supreme	 Court	
further	argued	that	in	order	to	respect	the	separation	of	powers	and	the	principle	of	supremacy	of	
the	 constitution,	 each	 body	 has	 the	 obligation	 to	 act	 within	 its	 competence	 and	 not	 beyond.	
Consequently,	 the	 judiciary	 in	 general	 (and	 the	 Court	 itself	 in	 particular)	 must	 assess	 the	
limitations	 of	 the	 powers	 of	 such	 bodies.	 Judicial	 intervention	 becomes,	 therefore,	 essential	 to	
guarantee	constitutional	supremacy.	

In	fact,	according	to	this	case	law,	if	there	are	limits	to	constitutional	reforms,	it	is	necessary	
that	there	is	also	a	subject	entitled	to	enforce	them.	If	violations	of	the	constitution	were	allowed	
and	no	remedy	provided,	 legal	certainty	would	be	affected,	precisely	because	the	constitution	 is	
the	source	from	which	all	other	sources	take	their	legitimation.	

Limits	 to	amendments,	 in	 fact,	are	directed	 in	 the	 first	place	 to	political	actors,	 in	particular	
the	 legislator	and	the	government.	Only	secondarily	they	concern	constitutional	Courts.	The	first	
guarantee	 of	 respect	 for	 these	 limits	 needs	 to	 be	 the	 self-restraint	 of	 political	 forces,	 if	 a	 truly	
democratic	and	pluralist	 system	must	be	based	on	a	culture	of	constitutional	ethics,	oriented	 to	
sharing	and	spreading	the	founding	values	of	the	legal	system.	The	intervention	of	Courts	happens	
only	 at	 a	 later	point,	 in	 those	 cases	where	 there	has	been	an	abuse	of	power	by	 the	 legislative	
and/or	the	executive.	

In	conclusion,	Constitutional	Courts’	 judgments	are	not	placed	 in	a	 legal	and	social	 vacuum.	
On	the	contrary,	they	can	and	should	refer	to	local	and	foreign	scholarship,	as	well	as	to	the	case	
law	 of	 other	 judicial	 bodies.	 Several	 major	 theses	 related	 to	 constitutional	 adjudication	 on	
constitutional	amendments	seem	to	be	circulating	 in	 judgments	of	different	 jurisdictions,	mostly	
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implicitly,	 but	 sometimes	 also	 expressly:	 from	 the	 idea	 of	 constitutional	 adjudication	 on	
constitutional	amendments	as	the	extrema	ratio	 to	the	vice	of	competence,	from	the	concept	of	
fundamental	 political	 decisions	 to	 the	 abuse	 of	 power,	 among	 others.	 The	 idea	 itself	 of	 “basic	
structure”	has	been	quoted	in	other	jurisdictions	explicitly	(in	the	same	continent	but	also	further	
away,	like	in	Colombia),	and	even	when	it	is	not	the	case,	it	is	known.	Circulation	can	be	detected	
both	within	 the	 same	 formant	 and	 throughout	 crossing	 formants,	 even	 if	 the	 sensitivity	 of	 the	
subject	frequently	leads	Courts	to	a	moderate	(or	null)	use	of	foreign	cases,	especially	those	Courts	
that	are	usually	reluctant	to	refer	to	comparative	law.	
	
References	
	
ALBERT,	 R.	 2018.	 Constitutional	 Amendment	 and	 Dismemberment.	 Yale	 Journal	 of	
International	Law,	43(1):1-84.	
ALBERT,	 R.	 et	 al.	 2018.	 The	 Formalist	 Resistance	 to	 Unconstitutional	 Constitutional	
Amendments.	Hastings	Law	Journal,	70(3):639-670.	
BARILE,	 P.;	 DE	 SIERVO,	 U.	 1968.	 Revisione	 della	 Costituzione.	 In:	 Aa.Vv.,	Novissimo	 Digesto	
italiano.	Vol.	XV.	Torino,	UTET,	773-793	p.	
BARILE,	P.	1967.	Scritti	di	diritto	costituzionale.	Padova,	CEDAM,	749	p.	
BASU,	D.	D.	2014.	Comparative	Constitutional	Law.	Gurgaon,	LexisNexis,	496	p.	
BERNAL	PULIDO,	 C.	 2013.	Unconstitutional	 constitutional	 amendments	 in	 the	 case	 study	 of	
Colombia:	 An	 analysis	 of	 the	 justification	 and	 meaning	 of	 the	 constitutional	 replacement	
doctrine.	International	Journal	of	Constitutional	Law	(I•CON),	11(2):339-357.	
BERNALES	 BALLESTEROS,	 E.	 2005.	 Los	 caminos	 de	 la	 reforma	 constitucional	 en	 el	 Perú.	
Anuario	de	Derecho	Constitucional	latinoamericano,	1:157-174.	
BURGOA	ORIHUELA,	I.	1985.	Derecho	Constitucional	Mexicano.	Mexico	City,	Porrúa,1034	p.	
CEPEDA	 ESPINOSA,	 M.J.;	 LANDAU,	 D.	 2017.	 Colombian	 Constitutional	 Law.	 Leading	 Cases.	
Oxford,	OUP,	448	p.	
CUEVA,	M.	de	la.	1982.	Teoría	de	la	Constitución.	Mexico	City,	Porrúa,	283	p.	
DIXON,	 R.;	 LANDAU,	 D.	 2015.	 Transnational	 constitutionalism	 and	 a	 limited	 doctrine	 of	
unconstitutional	 constitutional	 amendment.	 International	 Journal	 of	 Constitutional	 Law	
(I•CON),	13(3):606-638.	
ETO	CRUZ,	G.	2009.	Control	constitucional	del	poder	político.	Navegando	por	los	archipiélagos	
de	la	 jurisprudencia	del	Tribunal	Constitucional	peruano.	In:	Aa.	Vv.	Memoria	del	X	Congreso	
Iberoamericano	de	Derecho	Constitucional,	vol.	II,	tomo	II,	Mexico	City-Lima,	IDEMSA,	553-598.	
FOWKES,	 J.	 2016.	 Building	 the	 Constitution.	 The	 Practice	 of	 Constitutional	 Interpretation	 in	
Post-Apartheid	South	Africa.	Cambridge,	CUP,	392	p.	
GAMBINO,	S.	2007.	La	revisione	della	Costituzione	fra	teoria	costituzionale	e	tentativi	(falliti)	
di	 “decostituzionalizzazione”:	 limiti	 sostanziali	 e	 Costituzione	 “materiale”.	 In:	 Id.	 and	 G.	
D’Ignazio	 (eds).	 La	 revisione	 costituzionale	 e	 i	 suoi	 limiti.	 Fra	 teoria	 costituzionale,	 diritto	
interno,	esperienze	straniere.	Milano,	Giuffrè,	1-24	p.	
GARCÍA	 BELAUNDE,	 D.	 2006.	 Sobre	 el	 control	 de	 la	 reforma	 constitucional	 (con	 especial	
referencia	a	la	experiencia	jurídica	peruana).	Revista	de	Derecho	Político,	66:477-500.	



Ragone	I	The	“Basic	Structure”	of	the	Constitution	as	an	Enforceable	Yardstick	in	Comparative	Constitutional	Adjudication	

	

Revista	de	Estudos	Constitucionais,	Hermenêutica	e	Teoria	do	Direito	(RECHTD),	11(3):327-340	 338	

GÖZLER,	 K.	 2008.	 Judicial	 review	 of	 Constitutional	 amendments.	 A	 comparative	 study.	 Bursa,	
Ekin,	126	p.		
GUASTINI,	R.	2003.	Rigidez	constitucional	y	límites	a	la	reforma	en	el	ordenamiento	italiano.	
Jurídica,	175-194	p.	
GUASTINI,	 R.	 2017.	 Identità	 della	 Costituzione	 e	 limiti	 alla	 revisione	 costituzionale	 (il	 caso	
colombiano)’.	 In:	 L.	 ESTUPIÑÁN	 ACHURY	 et	 al.	 (eds).	 Tribunales	 y	 Justicia	 Constitucional.	
Homenaje	a	la	Corte	Constitucional	Colombiana.	Bogotà,	Universidad	Libre,	69-94	p.	
HAIN,	K.-E.	 1999.	Die	Grundsätze	des	Grundgesetzes:	 eine	Untersuchung	 zu	Art.	 79	Abs.	 3	GG.	
Baden-Baden,	Nomos,	496	p.	
HEUN,	W.	2011.	The	Constitution	of	Germany.	A	Contextual	Analysis.	Oxford-Portland,	Hart,	241	
p.	
JOSHI,	D.	2015.	Constitutionalism	and	Basic	Structure.	New	Delhi,	Regal	Publications,	305	p.	
KRISHNASWAMY,	 S.	 2011.	 Democracy	 and	 Constitutionalism	 in	 India:	 A	 Study	 of	 the	 Basic	
Structure	Doctrine.	Oxford,	OUP,	280	p.		
LAKSHMINATH,	 A.	 2002.	 Basic	 Structure	 and	 Constitutional	 Amendments:	 Limitations	 and	
Justiciability.	New	Delhi,	Deep	&	Deep	Publications,	326	p.	
LANDAU,	 D.	 et	 al.	 2019.	 From	 Unconstitutional	 Constitutional	 Amendment	 to	 an	
Unconstitutional	Constitution?	Lessons	from	Honduras.	Global	Constitutionalism.	8(1):40-70.	
LEISNER,	W.	 1999.	 La	 revisione	 della	 Costituzione	 in	 Germania.	 In:	 E.	 ROZO	ACUÑA	 (ed.).	 I	
procedimenti	di	revisione	costituzionale	nel	diritto	comparato.	Atti	del	Convegno	internazionale	
organizzato	dalla	Facoltà	di	Giurisprudenza	di	Urbino	(23-24	aprile	1997).	Napoli,	ESI,	71-88	p.	
LUCIANI,	M.	 1992.	 I	 diritti	 fondamentali	 come	 limiti	 alla	 revisione	 della	 Costituzione.	 In:	 V.	
Angiolini	(ed.),	Libertà	e	giurisprudenza	costituzionale.	Torino,	Giappichelli,	121	p.	
LÜCKE,	J.	2007.	Art.	79.	In:	M.	SACHS	(ed.).	Grudgesetz-Kommentar.	Munich,	C.H.	Beck,	25-75.	
MARBURY,	W.L.	 1919-20.	 The	 limitations	 upon	 the	 amending	 power.	Harvard	 Law	 Review,	
33:223-235.	
MORELLI	RICO,	S.	2005.	Algunas	consideraciones	sobre	el	tratamiento	del	poder	de	reforma	
constitucional	 en	 la	 sentencia	 C-551	 de	 2003.	 In:	 J.	 Celis-Gómez	 (ed.),	 Reforma	 de	 la	
Constitución	y	control	de	constitucionalidad.	Bogotà,	Pontificia	Universidad	Javeriana,	445-500	
p.	
MORTATI,	 C.	 1952.	 Concetto,	 limiti,	 procedimento	 della	 revisione	 costituzionale.	 In:	 Id.	
Raccolta	di	scritti.	Vol.	II.	Scritti	sulle	fonti	del	diritto	e	sull’interpretazione.	Milano,	Giuffrè,	3-
41	p.	
MURPHY,	W.F.	1995.	Merlin’s	memory:	 the	past	and	future	 imperfect	of	 the	once	and	future	
polity.	 In:	 S.	 Levinson	 (ed.),	 Responding	 to	 imperfection.	 The	 theory	 and	 practice	 of	
constitutional	amendment.	Princeton,	PUP,	163-190	p.		
OSUNA	PATIÑO,	N.I.	2004.	La	sentencia	del	referendo:	guarda	de	 la	Constitución	ante	el	uso	
instrumental	 de	 la	 democracia.	 In:	 E.	 Montealegre	 Lynett	 (ed.),	 Anuario	 de	 Derecho	
Constitucional:	 análisis	de	 la	 jurisprudencia	de	 la	Corte	Constitucional.	Periodo	2002	y	primer	
semestre	de	2003.	Bogotà,	Universidad	Externado	de	Colombia,	23-40	p.		
PALERMO,	 F.	 2008.	 La	 revisione	 costituzionale	 e	 la	 crisi	 della	 semplicità.	 Spunti	
dall’esperienza	tedesca.	Rivista	di	diritto	costituzionale,	1:170-193.	



Ragone	I	The	“Basic	Structure”	of	the	Constitution	as	an	Enforceable	Yardstick	in	Comparative	Constitutional	Adjudication	

	

Revista	de	Estudos	Constitucionais,	Hermenêutica	e	Teoria	do	Direito	(RECHTD),	11(3):327-340	339	

PEGORARO,	L.	and	FERIOLI,	E.	2000.	Il	paradosso	di	Ross:	dibattiti	e	meta-dibattiti	sulle	meta-
riforme	 costituzionali	 in	 Italia.	 In:	 S.	 LABRIOLA	 (ed.).	 La	 transizione	 repubblicana.	 Studi	 in	
onore	di	Giuseppe	Cuomo.	Padova,	CEDAM,	259-295	p.	
PEGORARO,	L.	1999.	Tribunales	Constitucionales	y	revisión	de	la	Constitución.	Revista	de	las	
Cortes	Generales.	47:7-26.	
PFERSMANN,	O.	 1993.	 La	 révision	 constitutionnelle	 en	Autriche	 et	 en	Allemagne	 fédérale	 –	
Théorie,	pratique,	limites.	In:	L.	FAVOREU	(ed.).	La	révision	de	la	Constitution.	Paris,	PUAM,	7-
65	p.	
QUINCE	 RAMÍREZ,	 M.F.	 2006.	 La	 elusión	 constitucional.	 Una	 política	 de	 evasión	 del	 control	
constitucional	en	Colombia.	Bogotà,	Doctrina	y	Ley,	256	p.	
_____.	 2008.	Derecho	 constitucional	 colombiano.	 De	 la	 Carta	 de	 1991	 y	 sus	 reformas.	 Bogotà,	
Ibáñez,	818	p.	
RAGONE,	 S.	 2012.	 El	 control	 judicial	 de	 la	 reforma	 constitucional.	 Aspectos	 teóricos	 y	
comparativos.	Mexico	City,	Porrúa,	257	p.		
_____.	 2013.	 El	 control	material	 de	 las	 reformas	 constitucionales	 en	 perspectiva	 comparada.	
Teoría	y	Realidad	Constitucional,	31:391-405.	
_____.	2017.	The	Colombian	Constitutional	Court	and	the	Peace	Process.	Federalismi.it.,	Focus	
Human	Rights,	3:1-16.	
RAMÍREZ	CLEVES,	G.A.	 2006.	 El	 control	material	 de	 las	 reformas	 constitucionales	mediante	
acto	legislativo.	Revista	Derecho	del	Estado,	18:3-32.	
_____.	2016.	The	Unconstitutionality	of	Constitutional	Amendments	in	Colombia:	The	Tension	
Between	 Majoritarian	 Democracy	 and	 Constitutional	 Democracy.	 In:	 T.	 Bustamante	 et	 al.	
(eds),	Democratizing	 Constitutional	 Law	 Perspectives	 on	 Legal	 Theory	 and	 the	 Legitimacy	 of	
Constitutionalism.	New	York,	Springer,	213-229.	
REPOSO,	A.	1972.	La	forma	repubblicana	secondo	l’art.	139	della	Costituzione.	Padova,	CEDAM,	
130	p.	
RIPEPE,	 E.;	 ROMBOLI,	 R.	 (eds).	 1995.	 Cambiare	 Costituzione	 o	 modificare	 la	 Costituzione?	
Torino,	Giappichelli,	128	p.		
RODRÍGUEZ	GAONA,	R.	2006.	El	control	constitucional	de	la	reforma	a	la	Constitución.	Madrid,	
Dykinson,	198	p.		
ROMBOLI,	R.	1996.	Rottura,	revisione	o	riforma	“organica”.	Limiti	e	procedure.	Il	Ponte,	52(6):	
32-48	
ROZNAI,	 Y.	 2017.	 Unconstitutional	 Constitutional	 Amendments.	 The	 Limits	 of	 Amendment	
Powers.	Oxford,	OUP,	368	p.		
RUGGERI,	 A.	 2000.	 Note	 sparse	 per	 uno	 studio	 sulle	 transizioni	 di	 rilievo	 costituzionale.	
Rassegna	parlamentare,	42(1):35-74.	
_____.	 2005.	 Revisioni	 formali,	 modifiche	 tacite	 della	 Costituzione	 e	 garanzie	 dei	 valori	
fondamentali	dell’ordinamento.	Diritto	e	società,	4:451-517.	
SACCO,	R.	1991.	Legal	Formants:	A	Dynamic	Approach	to	Comparative	Law	(Installment	I	of	
II).	The	American	Journal	of	Comparative	Law.	39(1):1-34.	
SARKIN,	J.	 J.	1997.	The	Political	Role	of	the	South	African	Constitutional	Court.	South	African	
Law	Journal,	114(1):134-150.	



Ragone	I	The	“Basic	Structure”	of	the	Constitution	as	an	Enforceable	Yardstick	in	Comparative	Constitutional	Adjudication	

	

Revista	de	Estudos	Constitucionais,	Hermenêutica	e	Teoria	do	Direito	(RECHTD),	11(3):327-340	 340	

SEERVAI,	H.	M.	2015.	Constitutional	Law	of	India.	Gurgaon,	Universal	Law	Publishing,	3546	p.	
THIRUVENGADAM,	 A.	 K.	 2017.	 The	 Constitution	 of	 India:	 A	 Contextual	 Analysis.	 London,	
Bloomsbury,	296	p.		
VILA	CASADO,	I.	2007.	Fundamentos	del	Derecho	Constitucional	contemporáneo.	Bogotà,	Legis,	
537	p.	

	
Submetido:	02/12/2019	

Aceito:	05/02/2020	
	


